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BEST PRACTICE : 1 Title Amalgamation of Institutions for Nourishment of Students 

MoUs have been successfully established with various Colleges. It has paved the way for the 
implementation of several faculty exchange programmes. These programmes are designed to 
enhance academic collaboration, allowing educators to share their expertise, teaching 
methodologies, and research insights across different institutions. By facilitating the exchange 
of faculty members, these initiatives aim to enrich the educational experience for both 
students and teachers, fostering a culture of innovation and cross-cultural understanding 
within the academic community. 

In addition to these educational collaborations, MoUs have been signed with various 
philanthropic organizations. These alliances have resulted in the execution of numerous 
welfare initiatives that address focusing social issues and contribute to community 
development. Through these initiatives, resources are mobilized to improve access to education 
and other essential activities for underserved populations. The combined efforts of educational 
institutions and philanthropic organizations not only enhance the quality of education but also 
promote social responsibility and community engagement, ultimately leading to a more 
equitable and inclusive society. 

 

BEST PRACTICE : 2 Technology Triggers Happiness for Students 

The college website has recently undergone a comprehensive redesigning aimed at enhancing 
user experience and accessibility for all students. This updated platform now features a more 
intuitive layout, making it easier and beneficiary for students to navigate and find the 
information they need. 

In addition to the aesthetic improvements, the website has been enriched with valuable 
resources to support students in their academic pursuits. Notably, a dedicated forum has been 
created where students can access a wide range of study materials, including lecture notes, 
reading lists, and supplementary resources tailored to various courses. 

Furthermore, to aid in examination preparation and to provide insight into the assessment 
methods of the University of Kalyani, past university examination question papers have also 
been made available online. This initiative allows students to familiarize themselves with the 
format and types of questions they may encounter, thereby, enhancing their study strategies 
and boosting their confidence as they approach their university exams. 

Overall, these enhancements to the college website reflect a commitment to provide support to 
our students and foster a more engaging and enriched resource learning environment. 

 


